Re: Tara's Contract

Subject: Re: Tara's Contract

From: Ellen Riotto <ellen@southpark.la>

Date: 05/19/2017 03:45 PM

To: Robin Bieker <robin@biekerco.com>, Shelby Jordan
<sjordan@aegworldwide.com>, Daniel Taban <daniel@jadeent.com>, Robert
Buente <bbuente@1010dev.org>

We've paid about half her contract and are holding her most recent invoice. Attached here.

From: Ellen Riotto <ellen@southpark.la>

Date: Friday, May 19, 2017 at 3:40 PM

To: Robin Bieker <robin@biekerco.com>, Shelby Jordan <sjordan@aegworldwide.com>, Daniel
Taban <daniel@jadeent.com>, Robert Buente <bbuente@l@lOdev.org>

Subject: Tara's Contract

See attached.

Ellen Riotto

Interim Executive Director

South Park Business Improvement District
1100 S Flower St, Suite #3400, Los Angeles, CA 90015

ellen@southpark.la <mailto:ellen@southpark.la> | o. 213 663 1112 | c. 401 439 8147

southpark.la <http://www.southpark.la/> | Facebook <http://fb.com/SouthParkLosAngeles>
Twitter <https://twitter.com/southparkla> | Instagram <https://www.instagram.com
/southparkla/>

24/7 DISPATCH: 866-560-9346

—image001.png

SP

SOUTH PARK

1of2 10/19/2018 08:29 AM



Re: Tara's Contract

— Attachments:
image001.png 1.3 KB
2017.05.03 INVOICE SPSG35.pdf 211 KB

2 0f 2 10/19/2018 08:29 AM



